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About ACEI

ACADEMIC CREDENTIALS EVALUATION INSTITUTE, INC. (ACEI)
Founded in 1994, ACEI is a full-service company providing
complete and integrated services in-house in the areas of
international education research, credential evaluation, and
translation. And, through our Global Consulting Group®, we offer
our expertise in the following specialties: Media and Branding,
Global Pathways, and Diversity, Equity and Inclusion (DEI) to
interested institutions and organizations around the globe.
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Revoking Admissions Offers Over

Racists Comments

Rescinding acceptances isn't a new phenomenon, but amid a
national debate on racism, those decisions -- particularly at public
institutions -- are raising free speech concerns. To read more, click
here.

The Importance of Internationalizing

Medical Education

As we have learned in the COVID-19 crisis, the future of global
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healthcare lies in the collaborative competencies of the next
generation of internationally competent medical leaders. It is more
important than ever that we incorporate internationalization of
medical education into medical education. To read more, click here.

Image credit: University of Kansas

Student Ambassador Programs

Two international students, one in Canada and the other in
Australia, share their experiences being a student ambassador. To
read more, click here.
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Johns Hopkins, CHEA Release

Safety Guide for Opening Campuses

Groups collaborate on a guide for colleges on how to open
campuses safely in the future. To read more, click here.
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Trump Administration Expands

Immigration Restrictions

Immigration restrictions suspend entry for foreign workers coming
to U.S. through certain visa programs but spare a program
important for international students. To read more, click here.
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3 Court Victories in June 2020

Despite the sucker punch 2020 has thrown our way this year with
the COVID-19 global pandemic, this week has proven to be the
bringer of good news, as far as the legal system of the U.S. is
concerned. Here are three areas where we’ve witnessed positive
outcomes. To read more, click here.

How to Spot Fake Online Programs

ACEI hosted a webinar on “How to Spot Fake Online Programs,” with
Allen Ezell, as our special guest. If there was a moment in time that
we held our collective breath for the entirety of a talk, it was during
Allen’s presentation. He had us all on the edge of our seats as he
took us on a journey into the dark crevices of diploma mills,
accreditation mills, fake diplomas and the people running these
criminal operations. To read more, click here.
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Latin American HEIs and COVID-19

Challenges

Since the COVID-19 outbreak reached Latin American and
Caribbean countries around three months ago, more than 28
million university students (according to UNESCO Institute for
Statistics) are now learning remotely in the region. In the
meantime, both universities and students are facing truly intense,
unprecedented challenges in terms of technological infrastructure,
financial matters and resources, among others. To read more, click
here.

Helpful Sources:

Center for Disease Control

World Health Organization

Worldometers
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ACEI Additional Services

Digital Delivery of Evaluation

Reports: SecurePathway©:

ACEI is a proud signatory of the Groningen Declaration Network
which “seeks common ground in best serving the academic and
professional mobility needs of citizens worldwide by bringing
together key stakeholders in the Digital Student Data Ecosystem.”
For the past two years, ACEI has committed itself to this shared
mission through the introduction of SecurePathway©, an ACEI
proprietary digital platform for the secure delivery of official
evaluation reports and supporting educational credentials. For
information on ACEI’s SecurePathway©.

Signing up with ACEI’s SecurePathway©, is free and does not cost
the institutions any fees. To receive ACEI expert reports and
certified academic credentials via SecurePathway©, complete this
form.

SecurePathway Registration Form
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http://www.acei-global.org/pdf-forms/SecurePathwaysRegistrationForm.pdf
http://www.acei-global.org/pdf-forms/SecurePathwaysRegistrationForm.pdf
https://form.jotform.com/aceiglobal/secure-pathway-online-application-
https://form.jotform.com/aceiglobal/secure-pathway-online-application-


ACEI’s Global Consulting Group provide institutions and
organizations looking at expanding their international student
recruitment with customized solutions to help overcome
enrollment challenges, uncover opportunities, and devise an
innovative and holistic approach to international enrollment. For
more information visit: www.acei-global-consulting.org

ACEI offers a comprehensive range of professional services that
include: international credential evaluations; translations;
consulting; and training. For more information on ACEI, please visit
www.acei-global.org or contact: Tel: 1-310-275-3530; Email:
acei@acei-global.org.

ACEI was founded and incorporated in 1994 in the State of
California and is a Charter and Endorsed Member of the Association
of International Credential Evaluators (AICE).

©2024 ACEI | PO Box 6908 Beverly Hills CA, 90212
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